CJA 20 Worksheet - Attorney Time
Attorney: David Baker
Defendant: Tom Preston
Material Witness:
Criminal Case No: 2:12-00123-01
Mag. Case No:
Judge: Thomas E. Johnston
Bill Dates From: 5/1/12
To: 10/25/12
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Received phone call Re:
5/1/12 Appointment 01
5/1/12 Initial appearance hearing 0.1
Roundtrip from office located at 111
Virginia Street, Charleston, WV to
5/2/12 SCRJ 0.6
5/2/12 Waiting at jail to see client 0.2
5/2/12 Visited client at SCRJ 0.5
Research Re: Career offender
5/3/12 status 1.0
5/4/12 E-mail to AUSA Roy Rogers 0.2
Reviewed letter from defendant's
5/4/12 girlfriend 0.1
5/5/12 Arraignment/detention hearing 0.2
5/20/12 Interviewed witness, Robin Hood 0.4
Talked to Private Investigator about
5/30/12 witness interviews 0.6
6/2/12 Phone call from client 0.2
Reviewed 3 orders on co-
6/5/12 defendant's motions from CM/ECF 01
6/28/12 Meeting at co-counsel's office 1.0
Roundtrip from office in Charleston
6/28/12 to 27 Main Street, Dunbar, WV 0.7
Meet with defendant's family in office
7/9/12 re: case status 1.0
Prepare letter to defendant's doctor
8/3/12 Re: Defendant's health issues 0.2
8/28/12 Researched motion to suppress 3.1
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9/1/12 Drafted suppression motion 35
9/3/12 Reviewed letter from defendant 01
Discovery review; watched DVD of
9/4/12 controlled buy 1.0
Plea hearing (+ wait time because
9/13/12 docket was delayed) 0.6 0.2
9/18/12 Reviewed transcript of plea hearing 0.4
Attended co-defendnant's plea
9/20/12 hearing 0.7
9/20/12 E-mail from probation officer 01
9/28/12 Attend PSR Interview at SCRJ 15
Roundtrip from office in Charleston
9/28/12 to SCRJ 0.6
10/12/12 Review draft PSR 0.8
10/15/12 Prepare draft PSR Objections 12
10/22/12 Attend sentencing hearing 0.8
10/25/12 Review sentencing order 0.2
10/26/2012 Page 2 of 2 Revised 4-23-2012 ver 1



