

U.S. v. Tom Preston, 2:12-cr-00123-01

5/1/12 --	Rcd phone call re: apptmt	0.1
	Initial Appearance	0.1
5/2/12 --	Visited client at SCRJ	0.5
	Travel from office ¹ to SCRJ	0.6
	Waiting at jail	0.2
5/3/12 --	Research re: Career offender status	1.0
5/4/12 --	Email AUSA Roy Rogers	0.2
	Reviewed ltr from def's girlfriend	0.1
5/5/12 --	Arraignment/Detention hrg	0.2
5/20/12 --	Interviewed witness, Robin Hood	0.4
5/30/12 --	Talked to PI re: wit interviews	0.6
6/2/12 --	Recd phone call from client	0.2
6/5/12 --	Reviewed 3 orders re: co-defs' motions from CM/ECF	0.1
6/28/12 --	Meeting with co-counsel	1.0
	Travel from office to 27 Main St., Dunbar	0.7
7/9/12 --	Meet w/ def's family in office re: case status	1.0
8/3/12 --	Letter to def's dr. re: Def's health issues	0.2
8/28/12 --	Researched motion to suppress	3.1
9/1/12 --	Drafted suppression motion	3.5
	Filed suppression motion	0.1
9/3/12 --	Letter from def. – read	0.1
9/4/12 --	Reviewed discovery; watched DVD of drug buy	1.0
9/8/12 --	Helped def's mother with her will	0.4
9/13/12 --	Plea hearing (.6) (+ wait time .2 b/c docket was delayed)	0.8
9/18/12 --	Reviewed plea transcript	0.4
9/20/12 --	Co-def's plea hearing	0.7
	E-mail from PO	0.1
9/28/12 --	PSR at SRJ	1.5
	Travel from office to jail	0.6
10/12/12 --	Draft PSR – read	0.8
10/15/12 --	PSR Objections – did draft	1.2
10/22/12 --	Sentencing	0.8
10/25/12 --	Review J&C	0.2

¹ Office address: 111 Virginia St. E, Charleston

EXPENSES

5/2/12 -- Roundtrip from office to SCRJ, 16 miles
5/31/12 -- Copies total for August 2012 (30 x \$.10/page), \$3.00
6/28/12 -- Drove to/from atty off, 27 Main St., Dunbar. 18 mls; parking \$1.75; tolls \$8.00
6/30/12 -- Postage for June, 2012, \$2.86
7/2/12 -- Took def's mother out to dinner, \$32.00
7/8/12 -- Long distance phone charges for June, 2012, \$8.13 (BILL NEEDED)
7/29/12 -- Clothes for defendant to wear at plea hearing, \$45.00
8/15/12 -- Charge for medical records, \$25.00 (RECEIPT/INVOICE NEEDED)
9/11/12 -- Trial exhibit enlargements, \$18.00 (RECEIPT.INVOICE NEEDED)
9/27/12 -- Westlaw research, \$85.00 [RECEIPT/INVOICE NEEDED]